
$785,000 - 887 Garfield Pkwy, Bethany Beach
MLS® #90 

$785,000
4 Bedroom, 3 Bathroom, 2,400 sqft
Residential

Bethany Trace, Bethany Beach, Delaware

Beautiful coastal style home just 1 mile to the
beach! This 4 bedroom home features an
open floorplan with an impressive great room
that opens to a large screened porch and
wraparound deck creating the ideal setting for
gathering inside and out. Bright and airy, this
home is full of natural lighting and has
desirable features including vaulted ceilings,
hardwood and tile flooring, and a gas fireplace.
The primary bedroom suite is on the first floor
as well as a guest bedroom and another full
bathroom. Upstairs, there are 2 guest
bedrooms and another full bathroom. On the
ground level there is an outdoor shower,
storage area for all of your beach toys, and
plenty of covered parking with space for 5 cars
underneath the home. Offered fully furnished
(bikes, kayaks and beach loungers included)
this home is ready to be enjoyed! Situated in
the small community of Bethany Trace with
HOA fees covering flood and property
insurance, this home is offered fully furnished
and ready to be enjoyed. Conveniently located
within the town limits of Bethany so you have
the option to use your town-issued parking
permits to park at the beach or walk directly
across the street to the nearby beach trolley
stop.

Built in 2002

Essential Information

MLS® # DESU2057024



Price $785,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 2,400

Year Built 2002

Type Residential

Status Active

Community Information

Address 887 Garfield Pkwy

Subdivision Bethany Trace

City Bethany Beach

State Delaware

Zip Code 19930

Interior

Stories 2


